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Policing
SECOND EDITION

1.	 PRICE and VALUE – By far the best and most affordable Policing 
text on the market

2.	 NEW full-color design and photos engage students in the 
content and enhance the learning experience

3.	 Two NEW chapters cover public health and terrorist policies 
to keep readers on the forefront of contemporary issues police 
officers encounter

4.	 NEW case studies discuss current topics students see in news 
and media, such as the Michael Brown case and the Black Lives 
Matter movement

5.	 NEW discussions on highly debated recent events, including 
police under unprovoked attacks, police use of drones, transfer of 
deadly pathogens among officers, human trafficking, and more

6.	 The popular Ripped From the Headlines case studies have 
been updated and modernized to provide current real-life 
application

7.	 Explains policing from the inside with personal experiences 
from officers on the job, offering a realistic sense of working in this 
dynamic field

8.	 Combines theory and practicality through investigative reports 
about police organizations, case studies, narratives from violators, 
and current research and impressions from colleagues, officers, 
and researchers

9.	 Outstanding pedagogy – Each chapter includes learning 
objectives, key terms, introductions and summaries, discussion 
questions, and case studies to guide learning and ensure 
comprehension

10.	 Instructor resources – Spend less time planning and more 
time teaching with a complete Test Bank and lecture slides in 
PowerPoint format
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Create your own unique textbook aligned with your syllabus and 
course objectives! You can pull chapters from across our content 

library to prepare your printed book or eBook.
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